6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200 » FAX (607) 334-9848

COOPERATIVE
PURCHASING

COMPUTER HARDWARE & SUPPLIES
BID #2024-108

DCMO BOCES INFORMATION
142 Whaupaunaucau Rd
Norwich, NY 13815
Contact: Jackie Lisk
Phone #: 607-335-1238

Jackie.lisk@dcmoboces.com

Bid Prices Expire on October 31, 2024



6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200 * FAX (607) 334-9848

To: Participating Districts
From: Jackie Lisk
Date: May 1, 2024

Re: Cooperative Purchasing Computer Hardware & Supply Bid Awards #2024-108

RESULTS & AWARDS:
The bid was opened on March 6, 2024 and resulted in eight bids.

On April 3, 2024, the bid award recommendations were presented to the DCMO BOCES Board.
The bid award recommendations were approved and awarded by the Board.

Please see the attached “Computer Hardware & Supply Bid Awards” in a PDF format. These are the
results of the bid award recommendations. Any district in the service may take advantage of this award,
even if the district did not participate in the initial requisitioning of items. The vendor contact sheet will
give you additional information regarding the awarded bidder, such as the address, phone number, contact
person, etc.

Please make sure your PO’s include the Bid Number 2024-108

IMPORTANT BID INFORMATION:
Please note that according to our contract the awarded vendors must follow these contract terms:

e Must deliver and invoice within 35 days from the date the vendor confirms they received the
purchase order. (If a vendor fails to deliver in this time, please contact our office, as we may
implement the Buy Against Clause)

Pricing is firm until 10/31/24.

Must provide the brand they specified on the bid throughout the bid contract.

Must not substitute any item unless they have advance approval from the district.

Cannot say an item is discontinued or no longer available, and offer you a higher priced item. —

PLEASE CONTACT US IMMEDIATELY - Substitutions must be at the bid price.

Must not include shipping, handling or fuel surcharges on any order meeting minimum.

e You can combine orders for other items not on bid with any purchase order containing bid items
to reach the minimum ordering amount (if applicable).

DISCOUNTS:

The vendors who offer discounts off their website or catalog are listed below. If the item you need is not
within this bid, you can search for the item utilizing the discounts from the vendors to ensure that you are
getting the best possible price. Sometimes a 15% discount from one vendor is better than a 20% discount
from another vendor but you must do your research and also look at minimum order amounts. Please
review the discount analysis for further information.
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NO BID ITEMS/REJECTED ITEMS

If you see any price that shows as $0.00 on any reports or online this means the item in question did NOT
RECEIVE A BID. The item was either discontinued or not available from the vendors who provided a
bid. The No Bid items may have a suitable substitution within the bid awards.

PRODUCT QUALITY / VENDOR ISSUE RESOLUTION PROCESS:
If you have a Product Quality problem or Vendor Issue, please follow the process below:
1. Call the vendor contact person. Note the date and time you called about the issue. Make sure to
have them give you a time or date that the problem will be resolved. Make sure you get the
person’s name and their phone number.

2. If the problem is not resolved or the person you spoke to is not responsive to correcting the
problem, please email us the information below:

Details of the problem

The company you having an issue with

The PO Number and/or Invoice number

Your customer number

The person’s name at the company you spoke to about the issue and their phone #

Variance form

moe oo o

Once we have the information we will work with the vendor and copy you on the email. If you need to
speak with us for any reason, you can email us at cooppur@dcmoboces.com. Feel free to call or email us
with your issues or concerns. We will try our best to get it sorted!

READING THE PDF AWARDS:
To search the PDF, there is a “find” box in the tool bar or use CTL & F on your keyboard. A search bar
will appear and from there you can type in any keyword to find the items you are looking for.
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Vendor Contact Information

Vendor Contact Phone/Fax Notes/Ref #
Atlaz International Andre Zalta
244 E Merrick Rd andrez(@atlaz.com P: 516-239-1854 $50.00 minimum order
Freeport, NY 11520 www.atlaz.com
B & H Photo Video Jason Schwartz P: 212-239-7503
420 Ninth Avenue NY @bhphotovideo.com x 7742 $49.00 minimum order
New York, NY 10001-1644 www.bhphotovideo.com F: 212-239-7759
Pyramid School Products Mandy Furlone No phone orders
6510 North 54™ St. orders@pyramidsp.com F- SIi 3-621-7688 $50.00 minimum order
Tampa, FL 33610-1908 www.pyramidsp.com )
Quill, LLC
300 Tri State International Dr Customer Service
Suite 200 e-orders@quill.com P:800-634-4309 No minimum order

Lincolnshire, IL 60069

www.quill.com

F:800-789-2016

School Specialty, LLC Orders Department .
) - . P: 800-388-3224 ..

140 Marble Drive Orders@schoolspecialty.com F- 888-388-6344 $25.00 minimum order

Lancaster, PA 17601 www.schoolspecialty.com )
Scott Electric Mark Troutmap P 855-726.8899 o
PO Box S mtroutman(@scottelectricusa.com F- 877-837-8906 No minimum order

Greensburg, PA 15601 www.projectorlampguru.com )

e g)e?ag? Zig ne djiIr)igl@d aillzigm P:800-595-6651 $50.00 Minimum Order

- F: 781-278-0706 ’ v

Norwood, MA 02062

www.thetreehouseinc.net

Discounts Offered for Items NOT on Bid

Please see our other bids for other discount offers

Vendor Dlsg/ount Applies to Exceptions/Exclusions:
(1)

Orders $49.00 and up are free delivery, except products
weighing more than 70 Ibs or requiring truck delivery will be

B & H Photo . ' charged reasonable shipping.

Video 1% Website

B&H kits & gift cards are excluded.
Manufacturer's unilateral prices will be 0% off.

Scott Electric 5% Website No minimum order for free delivery.
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DCMO BOCES Computer Equipment & Supplies Bid 2024-108

uo Description BOCES LUl Bid Price AU UL Company Name
M Item # Product # Brand
A.V. Equipment
EAC | Califone Listening Center, CD/Cassette, 6 Position, 6 401013 CALIFONE 1776PLC6 $269.98 Pyramid School Products
H Professional Stereo Headsets, Carrying Case - #1776PLC6 (NEW 1886PLC6) 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Portable Amplifier - Pyle Pro PWMA200 Wireless 13931 PYPWMA200 $74.50 B&H Photo Video
H Rechargeable (Black) (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Audioengine B1 Bluetooth Music Receiver 203067 AUB1 $139.00 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | SKB MC24 Waterproof Twenty Four Mic Case 2023705 SKMC24 $189.95 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | CALIFONE SPIRIT SD MULTIMEDIA PLAYER - 1886-HL/EACH 22569 1544020 $67.41 CALIFONE SPIRIT SD School Specialty, LLC
H MULTIMEDIA PLAYER - (Ref # Q-430299)
1886-HL/EACH
EAC | Radio - Boom Box - Califone Spirit 0139 1544020 $67.41 School Specialty, LLC
H USB/CD/Cassette/Bluetooth - 1886HL (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | DVD Player - Sony DVP-SR510H 13924 DVP-SR510H $52.00 Atlaz International
H
EAC | Behringer Eurolive VP1520 - 1000 Watt Passive PA Monitor 2023703 VP1520 $294.00 Atlaz International
H Speaker
EAC | 9" Portable DVD Player - Sylvania - SDVD9020B-BLACK 13925 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Sweetwater Sound, Fender Audio Passport Event S2 Portable 203073 NO BID NO BID
H PA System, PassEventS2
EAC | Fender Passport Conference Series 2 Portable Powered PA 31973 NO BID NO BID
H System (175W)
Apple Accessories
EAC | Apple Lightning to 3.5mm Headphone Jack Adapter 37792 Apple 6E3290 $7.99 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Apple USB Type-C to 3.5mm Headphone Jack Adapter 37791 Apple 24388310 $8.48 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Apple USB 3.1 Gen 1 Type-C Male to USB Type-A Female 14146 Apple IM1ZG6833IN $18.05 Quill LLC -
H Adapter - MJIM2AM/A (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Apple Lightning Digital AV Adapter 37794 Apple 164117A $42.49 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
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L9 Description g2 Uz Bid Price Al Company Name
M P Item # Product # Brand pany
EAC | Apple Digital AV Adapter - UTY-102811594 14147 NO BID NO BID

H

Battery Backup Units

EAC | Cyber Power CP550SLG Standby UPS - 350VA - 6 Outlets, 9100350 $69.00 CP550SLG Atlaz International
H 350VA / 255W - Audible Alarms.

Brother - Printer Cartridges

EAC | Brother TN430 Black Toner Catridge 6825 Brother 392466 $50.58 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Brother TN436BK High Yield Black Toner Cartridge 6902 Brother 2706120 $65.23 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Brother TN433C High Yield Cyan 8603 Brother 2697998 $98.36 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Brother TN433Y High Yield Yellow Toner Cartridge 6905 Brother 2697996 $98.39 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Brother TN436M Magenta Toner Cartridge 8359 TN436M $122.00 Atlaz International
H
Bulk Batteries
PKG | AAA Batteries, Duracell CopperTop Batteries - 36PK 5283 Duracell 413020 $14.45 Quill LLC -
(Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | AA Duracell Coopertop - BULK 144 5789 Duracell $59.62 Quill LLC -
MN1500BKDQ (Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | AAA Duracell Coppertop - BULK144 5790 Duracell MN2400BKD $59.62 Quill LLC -
(Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | CBattery - Duracell CopperTop Batteries - 72CT 5284 Duracell 606933 $68.89 Quill LLC -
(Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | D Battery - Duracell CopperTop Batteries - 72CT 5287 Duracell 569125 $70.06 Quill LLC -
(Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | AA Batteries Energizer - 36PK 5282 ENERGIZER EN91-36 $14.76 Pyramid School Products
2024-108(DCMO)
PKG | AA Batteries 1.5 V Energizer - 144/Pkg 1468118 ENERGIZER EN91-144 $53.28 Pyramid School Products
2024-108(DCMO)
PKG | AAA Batteries 1.5V Energizer Max - 144/Pkg 8661 ENERGIZER EN92-144 $59.04 Pyramid School Products

2024-108(DCMO)
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uo Description BOCES Ll Bid Price it Company Name
M Item # Product # Brand
Cables, Wires, Interfaces & Electrical
Adapters
EAC | 15' Heavy Duty Extension Cord 650543 650543 Go Green Power $10.58 Quill LLC -
H 24005476 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | HDMI Cable 15-foot braided grey 2023701 Datacomm 23978767 S11.11 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 25'Heavy Duty Extension Cord 650546 Go Green Power $14.39 Quill LLC -
H 24005573 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Surge Protector Belkin Mini with USB Charger - 6108 Belkin BZ103050TVL $16.71 Quill LLC -
H BZ103050-TVL (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | USB Type-C to Gigabit Ethernet Adapter 3594870 NXT Technologies $16.81 Quill LLC -
H 24400039 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | APC Back-UPS 650 8 Outlet Surge Protector and Battery 3594770 APC 373488 $75.06 Quill LLC -
H Backup (120v) (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 50' Extension Cord - 398817 398817 SOUTHWIRE 0268 $19.99 Pyramid School Products
H 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | 50' Patch Cable, Cat6, Cables To Go Snagless - White - 27166 271609H 27166 $14.05 The Tree House, Inc.
H
EAC | 7'Surge Suppressor, 7-Outlet Commercial - Belkin - 4509 BE107000-07-CM $21.55 The Tree House, Inc.
H BE107000-07-CM
EAC | 12' Tripp Lite Surge Protector Power Strip 120V 7 Outlet, 1619 TLP76RBTEL $23.00 The Tree House, Inc.
H RJ11
EAC | TrippLite High-Speed HDMI 4K Cable with Digital Video and 02095 P568-025-WH $25.80 The Tree House, Inc.
H Audio - 25ft., Male to Male, Ultra HD, White - P568-025-WH
EAC | Surge Protection, Belkin 10-Socket Metal SurgeMaster, 885 4510 F9D1000-15 $35.60 The Tree House, Inc.
H Joules, F9D1000-15
EAC | High Speed HDMI Cable with Ethernet (6') 3594570 2136115 $6.89 School Specialty, LLC
H (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | 6' HDMI Cable 271615 HDMI6 $5.90 Atlaz International
H
PKG | 8" Cable Tie, Black, 100/Pack 5272 CABLET-8-100 $12.50 Atlaz International
PKG | 3-pack HDMI Cables 10-foot black 2023699 HDMI10-3PACK $19.50 Atlaz International
EAC | Extension Cord - 10 ft. x 16/3 Gauge Indoor/Outdoor, 37100 $21.00 EXT10-ORANGE Atlaz International
H Orange, EXT10-Orange
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uo Description BOCES Ll Bid Price it Company Name
M Item # Product # Brand
EAC | Cable Adapter - USB-C to USB Female Adapter, 4" Cable 37151 USBC-USB $6.50 Atlaz International
H
EAC | The VDV MapMaster 3.0 Cable Tester Deluxe Pro Kit from 37165 T130K3 $641.00 Atlaz International
H Platinum Tools
PKG | Micro USB Cable 1ft, 6 Pack Fasgear Nylon Braided 12 inch 203111 SUBMICRO-6PACK $23.00 Atlaz International
Short Fast Charging USB Cord Android Charger Wire
Compatible with Galaxy S7 S6 J7 Note
5,LG,Moto,Sony,Nokia,Kindle, TV Stick,Powerbank 6-Color
EAC | Furman Merit Series M-8Dx 9-Outlet Power Conditioner 2023700 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | VANGUARD 3-Way Grounded Adapter 37150 NO BID NO BID
H
Camera Accessories
EAC | Tripod - Magnus DLX-363M Photo/Video Tripod with Pan 3919 MADLX363M $29.00 Magnus DLX-363M B&H Photo Video
H Head and Monopod with Smartphone Adapter and GoPro Photo/Video Tripod (Ref #2024108)
Mount with Pan Head and
Monopod with
Smartphone Adapter
and GoPro Mount
EAC | Magnus VT-4000 Tripod System with Fluid Head - MAVT4000 56108 MAVT4000 $129.00 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Camera/Camcorder Shoulder Bag - 9.5" Length - Ruggard 10382 RUVSY145B $14.00 B&H Photo Video
H Onyx 45 - VSY-145B (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Magnus PV-3310G Photo/Video Tripod with Geared Center 19031 MAPV3310G $14.00 Magnus PV-3310G B&H Photo Video
H Column with Smartphone Adapter and GoPro Mount Photo/Video Tripod (Ref #2024108)
with Geared Center
Column with
Smartphone Adapter
and GoPro Mount
EAC | Nikon ML-L3 Wireless Remote Control (Infrared) Product 50238 NIMLL3 $17.77 B&H Photo Video
H Highlights Wireless Remote Shutter Release Minimizes (Ref #2024108)

Vibrations Good for Close-ups & Time Exposures - NIMLL3
MFR # 4730
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EAC | ODE NT1 5th Generation Large-Diaphragm Cardioid 56113 RONT1GEN5B $212.42 ODE NT1 5th B&H Photo Video
H Condenser XLR/USB Microphone (Black) . Includes; SM6 Generation (Ref #2024108)
Shock Mount with Detachable Pop Filter Large-Diaphragm
Cardioid Condenser
XLR/USB Microphone
(Black) . Includes; SM6
Shock Mount with
Detachable Pop Filter
EAC | Orca OR-26 Trolley Backpack 56111 OROR26 $248.00 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC DJI OSMO POCKET 2 GIMBAL + HPRC 1400 Hard Case for DJI 56106 DJOP2 + $316.40 DJI OSMO POCKET 2 B&H Photo Video
H Pocket 2 HPOSMPKT14K2 GIMBAL + HPRC 1400 (Ref #2024108)
Hard Case for DJI Pocket
2
EAC | Manfrotto 290 Carbon Fiber Monopod 37156 MAMM?290C4US $89.00 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
Cameras, Video Equipment, Document
Cameras
PKG | Fujifilm Instax Mini Twin Pack Film - 20/Pack - For Instax 3382 Fujifilm 7941287 $13.98 Quill LLC -
Mini Camera - 16437396 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Lumens Ladibug DC193 HD Document Camera (Red) 13917 Lumens 24466515 $541.81 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | IpevoV, 4K Ultra High Definition USB Document Camera 139100 IPV4K $85.00 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Zoom Q2n-4K Handy Video Recorder 37152 Z0ZQ2N4K $152.82 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Zoom H6 All Black 6-Input / 6-Track Portable Handy Recorder 19205 ZOH6B $179.95 B&H Photo Video
H with Single Mic Capsule (Ref #2024108)
EAC Lumens DC132U HD/2K USB Document Camera 19203 LUDC132U $195.00 Lumens DC132U B&H Photo Video
H HD/2K USB Document (Ref #2024108)

Camera
EAC | Sweetwater Product: DJI Mic Wireless Transmission System 37155 DJMIC $216.58 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Denon DN-300R MKII Solid-State SD/USB Audio Recorder or 19200 DEDN30ORMKII $290.29 B&H Photo Video
H equivalent (Ref #2024108)
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EAC | Hollyland Mars 4K Wireless Video Transmission System 37153 HOMARS4K $538.00 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Canon EOS Rebel T7 DSLR Camera with 18-55mm and 13902 CAEDRT7L1 $539.90 B&H Photo Video
H 75-300mm Lenses Kit - 2727C021 (Ref #2024108)
EAC | DJI Mini 2 SE Drone 19201 DJM2SE $539.90 DJI Mini 2 SE Drone B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Panasonic HC-X2000 UHD 4K 3G-SDI/HDMI Pro Camcorder 56112 PAHCX2000 $1,739.0 Panasonic HC-X2000 B&H Photo Video
H with 24x Zoom 0 UHD 4K 3G-SDI/HDMI (Ref #2024108)
Pro Camcorder with 24x
Zoom
EAC | Logitech C920s HD Webcam - Autofocus, 8-Megapixel 14135 $69.00 LOG-C920s Atlaz International
H Snapshots, Built-in Microphone, Right Light 2 Technology,
Fold-and-Go, Swivel Design - LOG-C920s
EAC | Webcam - LOG-C920S- USB 2.0, Up to 5MP Photos, 720p HD 12801 $69.00 LOG-C920s Atlaz International
H Video, Auto Focus, ClearFrame Technology, Built-in Digital
Microphone, TrueColor Technology, Flexible Stand
Canon - Printer Cartridges
EAC | Canon 119 Black Toner Cartridge 8937 Canon 3479B001AA $87.71 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
CD & DVD Discs
PKG | CD-R 700MB Disc (Spindle Pack of 50) 6012 Verbatim 210189 $16.22 Quill LLC -
(Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | CD-R 700MB Disc (Spindle Pack of 100) 6008 Verbatim 479609 $16.45 Quill LLC -
(Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG DVD-R 4.76GB 16x White Inkjet Printable (100 Pack) 6021 Verbatim $36.33 Quill LLC -
IM1DM4838IN (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Bad Education DVD 37157 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Premium Quality Recording Surface Recordable CD (Audio 56110 NO BID NO BID
H Only) for Noise Free Playback and CD Drive Playback
Chromebooks
EAC | Chrome Notebook 37011 Asus 24549588 $282.79 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
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EAC | Lenovo 14" N42 Series 16GB Chromebook 1.6 GHz Intel 13916 $424.00 82W6000AUS Atlaz International
H Celeron N3060 Dual-Core, 4GB RAM | 16GB, Intel Graphics,
SD Card Reader, Wi-Fi - Bluetooth, 2 x USB 3.0,Chrome OS - #
82W6000AUS
EAC | Acer 15.6 inch Chromebook 515 HD, i7 processor, 37170 $990.00 NX.KRCAA.006-ACER Atlaz International
H NX.KRCCAA.006-ACER
Computer Cleaning Products
EAC | Dust-Off Touch Screen Wipes - 80/TUBE 5792 3M CL610 $7.81 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Microfiber cleaning cloths for Electronics 5795 MONARCH $1.99 Pyramid School Products
H M915107BL 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Disposable Compressed Air, Dust Off Blaster - Canned Air - 10 1692 FALCON DPSXL $4.48 Pyramid School Products
H Oz Can 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Fellowes Screen Cleaning Wet Wipes, 5.12" x 5.90", 100/Tub 1690 NO BID NO BID
H (99703)
EAC | Dust-Off 3.50z - Falcon, Spray Can 5791 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Alcohol Cleaning Wipes for Electronics 5793 NO BID NO BID
H
Creative Tablets & Pens
EAC | Rocketbook lined notebook 140565 Rocketbook $20.48 Quill LLC -
H EVR2EKCRR (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Rocketbook Everlast Notebook - Executive size 140564 Rocketbook 24453239 $26.97 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC HP SB ELITEDESK 82J80UT |7 MINI 37012 $1,085.0 82J80UT i7 MINI Atlaz International
H 0
EAC | Rocketbook Wave Notebook 140578 NO BID NO BID
H
Deskjet-HP Printers
EAC | HP Desklet 1112 Printer - Up to 7.5 ppm (Black), Up to 5.5 4412 NO BID NO BID
H ppm (Color), 4800 x 1200 dpi, USB 2.0, ENERGY STAR
certified - F5S23A#B1H - 13674668
Label Makers, Labels & Tape
BOX | 1-1/8" X 3-1/2" Address Labels, Dymo - 260 Labels/Roll - 2 8860 Dymo 30251Q $7.67 Quill LLC -

Rolls/Box - 30251

(Quill Bid #24-32007)
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EAC | 1/4" X 26' Black on White Tape for Brother P-Touch Labeler - 6140 Brother TZE211 $7.72 Quill LLC -

H TZE211 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 1/2" X 26' Black on White Tape for Brother P-Touch Labeler - 5293 Brother TZE231 $8.86 Quill LLC -

H TZE231 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 1/2" X 26' Black on Clear Tape for Brother P-Touch Labeler - 5292 Brother TZE131 $9.14 Quill LLC -

H TZE131 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 3/4" X 26' Black on Yellow Tape for Brother P-Touch Labeler - 6146 Brother TZE641 $11.17 Quill LLC -

H TZE641 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
BOX | 2-1/8" X 4" Labels - Dymo Label Writer - 30323 4522 Dymo 30323Q $12.41 Quill LLC -

(Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | 1 X1 Inch Dymo Labels, White - 750 Roll/Box 30332 30332 Dymo IM1133248IN $15.62 Quill LLC -
(Quill Bid #24-32007)

EAC | P-Touch Laberler PT-H110, Easy Handheld Label Maker 05469 Brother PTH110 $26.36 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | DYMO LabelManager 160 Handheld Label Maker 5915 Dymo 1790415 $31.80 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | 9/16" X 3-7/16" - Dymo LabelWriter File Folder Labels, 038588 038588 $9.25 School Specialty, LLC

White, 130/Pkg (Ref # Q-430299)

EAC P-Touch Label Maker, PT-D210 Brother 1543844 NO BID NO BID

H
EAC Dymo Label Writer 450 - C45-5562 4521 NO BID NO BID

H

Epson - Printer Cartridges

EAC | Epson T602400 Yellow Ink Cartridge 37190 Epson 2741951 $99.99 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Epson T602200 Cyan Ink Cartridge 37191 Epson 2741884 $109.54 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC EPSON 676XL Printer ink for WP-4530 - Cyan 56123 T676XL420 $24.30 The Tree House, Inc.

H
EAC EPSON 676XL Printer ink for WP-4530 - Magenta 56122 T676XL320 $24.30 The Tree House, Inc.

H
EAC | EPSON 676XL Printer ink for WP-4530 - Yellow 56121 T676XL220 $24.30 The Tree House, Inc.

H
PKG | EPSON 676XL Printer ink for WP-4530 - Black 56091 T676XL120 $37.80 The Tree House, Inc.
EAC | Epson SureColor T-Series Replacement Ink Maintenance Tank 37171 T619300 $60.00 The Tree House, Inc.
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EAC | Epson T602, 110 ml Light Light Black UltraChrome K3 Ink 37159 NO BID NO BID
H Cartridge

EAC | Epson T602, 110 ml Light Black UltraChrome K3 Ink Cartridge 37160 NO BID NO BID
H

EAC | Epson T602, 110 ml Vivid Light Magenta UltraChrome K3 Ink 37161 NO BID NO BID
H Cartridge

EAC | Epson T602, 110 ml Light Cyan UltraChrome K3 Ink Cartridge 37162 NO BID NO BID
H

EAC | Epson T602, 110 ml Vivid Magenta UltraChrome K3 Ink 37163 NO BID NO BID
H Cartridge

EAC | Epson T602, 110 ml Photo Black UltraChrome K3 Ink 37164 NO BID NO BID
H Cartridge

USB Jump Drive/Flash Drive

EAC | 16GB Digital Memory SD Card 6208 Centon 518045 $11.99 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 32GB SDHC Card 6092 1333325 $8.33 School Specialty, LLC
H (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | 64 GB Flash Memory SD Card 50191 1573467 $12.12 School Specialty, LLC
H (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | PNY Elite Performance 64GB Flash Memory High Speed SDXC 56124 NO BID NO BID

H Class 10 UHS-I (P-SDX64U395-GE)
EAC | SanDisk 64GB Ultra MicroSDXC UHS-I Memory Card with 56125 NO BID NO BID

H Adapter - 100MB/s, C10, U1, Full HD, A1, Micro SD Card -
SDSQUAR-064G-GN6MA

EAC | Flash Card Reader / Writer - All In One USB 2.0 Digital - SDHC 6086 NO BID NO BID

H

Graphics Card

EAC | AMD Radeon RX6600XT (8GB) 1180 $498.00 RX6600XT Atlaz International

H

Hard Drive

EAC | Seagate Portable 2TB External Hard Drive HDD — USB 3.0 for 2023709 Seagate 24493052 $62.62 Quill LLC -

H PC, Mac, PlayStation, & Xbox -1-Year Rescue Service (Quill Bid #24-32007)

(STGX2000400)

Headphones & Speakers
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EAC | Headphones - Stereo - Maxell HP-200F - Lightweight 1613 SENTRY HO416 $2.49 Pyramid School Products
H 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Headphone - Cyber Acoustics ACM-70B Lightweight 22571 SENTRY HO417 $2.98 Pyramid School Products
H PC/Audio Stereo Dynamic Drivers, Adjustable. 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Stereo Headphone, Califone CA2, Individual Storage 30335815 CALIFONE CA2 $4.99 Pyramid School Products
H 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Headphones - Binaural Kensington 33137 Hi-Fi, Black 1116832 SENTRY HM800 $7.98 Pyramid School Products
H 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | First Stereo Listening Headphone, Califone 2800-BL - Blue 30653150 CALIFONE 2800BL-CT $8.98 Pyramid School Products
H 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Headphones - Binaural - Califone 1534BK 1543845 CALIFONE 1534BK $9.99 Pyramid School Products
H 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Headphone First Kids Panda Theme, Listening, Wired - 089444 CALIFONE 2810PA $10.89 Pyramid School Products
H Califone 2810-PA 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | First Stereo Listening Headphone with Mic. - Califone 31155 CALIFONE 2800RDT $11.99 Pyramid School Products
H 2800-RDT - AV, Red (NEW #KHO8GT-RD) 2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Califone HS-PA Hush Buddy Panda Themed Earmuff Hearing 1543887 CALIFONE HSPA $13.98 Pyramid School Products
H Protector 2024-108(DCMO)
PKG | 18 Pack Kids Headphones Bulk Class Headphones for 37196 SENTRY HO261-18 $68.22 Pyramid School Products
Classroom School Students-Individually Wrapped Adjustable 2024-108(DCMO)
over Ear Head Earbuds with Wire for Kids/ Adults-Multicolor
SET | Headphones - Stereo - 12/pkg - Califone 3060AVS12 24267 CALIFONE 3060AVS12 $137.95 Pyramid School Products
2024-108(DCMO)
EAC | Hearing Protector - Califone 2810BE-AV Hush Buddy Bear 1543886 2810-BE $15.55 The Tree House, Inc.
H Themed Earmuff
EAC | Earbuds - JVC Gumy (Black) - HA-F160B 10865 Hamilton Buhl HA-Bud $2.75 Scott Electric
H
EAC | Headphones - Deluxe - with Volume Control Over-The-Head - | 30067032 Hamilton Buhl M8BK1 $8.60 Scott Electric
H V7 - (HA510-2NP)
EAC | Califone Headset - Blueberry Mono - 2924AV-P-BL 251709 Hamilton Buhl ST1BK $10.25 Scott Electric
H
EAC | Headphones - LS9000 Labsonic Heavy Duty Stereo - 50264 Hamilton Buhl ST1BK $10.25 Scott Electric
H WB-SL9000
EAC | Headphones - Rode NTH-100 Professional Over-the-Ear 2023704 RONTH100 $112.66 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
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EAC | Stereo Headset and Boom Mic - Cyber Acoustics AC-201 11916 CYAC201 $8.80 B&H Photo Video
H Noise-Canceling Microphone Technology - Adjustable. 30mm (Ref #2024108)
Dynamic Drivers.
EAC | Headset - Mono - Jabra Engage 65 JAE65HSM 37015 JAE65HSM $208.72 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Logitech 72906 5.1 Surround Sound Speaker System 2023101 LOZ906 $354.61 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Earbud - Califone E1, 3.5 mm Jack 31969 1512677 $0.58 School Specialty, LLC
H (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | Califone HS-TI Hush Buddy Tiger Themed Earmuff Hearing 56090 1543888 $6.81 School Specialty, LLC
H Protector (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | Headphone Listening First Kids Tiger Theme Wired - Califone 089443 2103818 $7.53 School Specialty, LLC
H 2810-TI (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | Headphones - Califone 3068AV - full size - Black 21226 2103819 $7.70 School Specialty, LLC
H (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | Stereo Headset for Kids K - Cyber Acoustics AC-4000 - 12. 23128 $11.90 AC-4000 Atlaz International
H Adjustable, 3.4mm connector, Built in sound, dual ear
volume control. Tough, durable design.
EAC | Speakers - Logitech Z150, Stereo Sound, 5 Watts, Built-in 1164 $33.00 LOG-Z150 Atlaz International
H Headphone Jack, Volume Control, Power Control, 3.5mm
Plug, Black
PKG | Headphones - Bulk Earbuds Individually Bagged 50 Pack 6 50237 JF-75 $52.00 Atlaz International
Assorted Colors For Schools, Libraries, Hospitals
EAC | Speaker with 12" Woofer and 1.75" Driver, Passive PA, 800W, 1064100 NO BID NO BID
H 2-Way, Behringer
EAC | GripStick Headphone plug extractor 11640 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Headphones - Wireless Noisehush i9 Bluetooth Active 1458282 NO BID NO BID
H Noise-Canceling - (White and Beige) - Foldable, #13796
EAC | Headphones - Stereo/Mono - Cushioned, Avid - 69984 NO BID NO BID
H 2EDUMDG66RDSS32
HP-Printer Cartridges
EAC | HP 62 Original Black Toner Cartridge 38174 HP C2P04AN $15.74 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | HP 410A High Yield Laserjet Yellow Toner Cartridge - CE505A 04042 HP CF412A $111.21 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
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EAC | Compatible to HP 39A Laserjet Black Toner Cartridge 2923 RTHP39AWC $35.00 compatible The Tree House, Inc.
H

PKG | HP 60 Black & Tri-Color Original Ink Cartridges, 2 Pack - 50235 N9H63FN $44.90 The Tree House, Inc.

N9H63FN

EAC | HP 89X (CF289X) High Yield Black Original LaserJet Toner 203095 CF289X $134.60 The Tree House, Inc.
H Cartridge

EAC | HP 902 Ink Cartridge - Magenta 37010 T6L90AN#140 $11.50 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 962 Yellow Ink Cartridge 36723 3HZ98AN $17.50 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 962 Cyan Ink Cartridge 36721 3HZ96AN $18.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 962 Magenta Ink Cartridge 36722 3HZ97AN $18.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 62 Original Tri-Color Toner Cartridge 38176 C2P06AN#140 $19.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 952 Cyan Ink - LOS49AN 50223 LOS49AN $19.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 952 Magenta Ink - LOS52AN 50224 LOS52AN $19.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 952 Yellow Ink Cartridge - LOS55AN 50225 LOS55AN $19.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 902 XL Cyan 56097 T6MO02AN#140 $22.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 962 Original Black Toner Cartridge 38173 3HZ99AN $25.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 952 Black Ink Cartridge - FEU15AN 50222 F6U15AN $28.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 951XL Cyan Ink - CNO46AN 50250 CNO46AN $29.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC HP 951XL Magenta Ink - CNO47AN 50251 CNO47AN $29.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 951XL Yellow Ink - CNO48AN 50252 CNO48AN $29.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 962XL - Cyan Ink Cartridge 365414 3JA00AN $29.00 Atlaz International
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EAC | HP 962XL - Magenta Ink Cartridge 2023713 3JA01AN $29.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 962XL - Yellow Ink Cartridge 2023714 3JA02AN $29.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 61 XL Black 36724 CH563WN#140 $37.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 62 XL Black 36726 C2P0O5AN#140 $37.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC HP 63XL Black Ink, Desklet (FEUB4AN) - f6UB4AN 50260 f6UG4AN $37.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 902 XL Black 56102 T6M14AN#140 $37.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 962XL - Black Ink Cartridge 2023712 3JAO3AN $38.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC HP 61XL Tri-Color Toner Cartridge 38177 CH564WN#140 $39.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 62XL Tri-Color Toner Cartridge 38175 C2P07AN#140 $39.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 63XL Tricolor Ink, Desklet - FBU63AN 1611537 F6UG3AN $39.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 950XL Black Ink - CNO45AN 50249 CNO45AN $42.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 138A Black Standard Yield Toner Cartridge 37158 W1380A $44.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 126A Cyan Toner Cartridge 1326 CE311A $49.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 126A Magenta Toner Cartridge 1331 CE313A $49.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 126A Yellow Toner Cartridge 1330 CE312A $49.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 30A, CF230A, ORIGINAL YIELD, BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 38164 CF230A $54.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 83A, CF283A, ORIGINAL, BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 38165 CF283A $54.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 410A Laserjet Black Toner Cartridge - CF410A 04022 CF410A $72.00 Atlaz International
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EAC | HP O5A Black Toner Cartridge - CE505A 3400 CE505A $76.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 30X, CF230X HIGH YIELD BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 38163 CF230X $81.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 58A Black Toner Cartridge for LaserJet Pro Printer (Model 37168 CF258A $84.00 Atlaz International
H MFP M428fdn)

EAC | HP 410A Laserjet Cyan Toner Cartridge - CF411A 004017 CF411A $94.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 410A Laserjet Magenta Toner Cartridge - CF413A 004013 CF413A $94.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 410A Laserjet Yellow Toner Cartridge - CF412A 36727 CF412A $94.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 26A Laserjet Black Toner Cartridge 04067 CF226A $99.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 83A, CF283AD, 2 PACK, ORIGINAL BLACK TONER 38166 CF283AD $99.00 Atlaz International
H CARTRIDGE

EAC | HP 410X High Yield Black Toner Cartridge 004018 CF410X $124.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 78A Laserlet Toner Catridges - 2-Pack - Black 56105 CF278AD $129.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 410X High Yield Laserjet Cyan Toner Cartridge 004016 CF411X $159.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 410X High Yield Laserjet Magenta Toner Cartridge 004015 CF413X $159.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 410X High Yield Laserjet Yellow Toner Cartridge 004014 CF412X $159.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP M750 Toner Cartridges for laser printer - CE270A 50193 CE270A $198.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP 87X Black Laser Jet Toner for M506N Printer - CF287X 50215 CF287X $248.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP M750 Toner Cartridges for laser printer - CE271A 50197 CE271A $324.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP M750 Toner Cartridges for laser printer - CE272A 50196 CE272A $324.00 Atlaz International
H

EAC | HP M750 Toner Cartridges for laser printer - CE273A 50195 CE273A $324.00 Atlaz International
H

HP-Printers
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EAC | HP Color Laserjet Pro - Copy/fax/print/scan - wireless 9657 HP 24423680 $374.00 Quill LLC -
H printing, Wi-Fi Direct, NFC touch-to-print technology, (Quill Bid #24-32007)
two-sided duplex printing, 4.3-inch color touchscreen,
50-sheet auto document feeder.
Keyborads, Mice & Combos
EAC | Optical Mouse - USB OEM - Comfortable, Ambidextrous 9685 Logitech 911687 $6.10 Quill LLC -
H Design, USB Connectivity, 3 Buttons, Corded Mouse, Optical (Quill Bid #24-32007)
Tracking, 800 dpi Resolution, Smooth Operator, Zero Setup,
Black - Logitech B100
EAC | Allsop Pro, Blue/Combo 401700 Allsop 30206UNI $7.32 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Gel Mouse Pad Wrist Rest, Ergonomic, Kensington Wrist 6027 Kensington 813826 $10.13 Quill LLC -
H Pillow - Black (KMW57822) (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Logitech M185 Wireless Mouse, Black - LOG910002225 50216 Logitech 100288 $12.02 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Gel Wrist Rest Mouse Pad Combo, Fellowes - Black 22536 Fellowes 9181201 $13.61 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Gel Mousepad Wrist Rest, Kensington Duo - Blue and Black - 51440 Kensington $14.57 Quill LLC -
H K62401AM IM11R4856IN (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Logitech K270 Wireless Keyboard, USB Unifying Receiver, 50217 Logitech 920003051 $16.99 Quill LLC -
H Black - LOG920003051 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
SET | Wireless Keyboard and Mouse Combo - 2.4 GHz, 6838 Logitech 57256L $21.38 Quill LLC -
Plug-and-Play, Eight Hot Keys, USB - Logitech MK270 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Keyboard, Wireless Solar - 2.4GHz, Plug-and-Play, 29200 Logitech 920002912 $34.99 Quill LLC -
H Light-Powered, Unifying Receiver, Thin Profile - Logitech (Quill Bid #24-32007)
920-002912 K750
EAC | 3M Nonskid Mouse Pad 9x8 in 2023855 MP114-BSD1 $4.50 The Tree House, Inc.
H
EAC | Gel Wrist Pad, Belkin WaveRest - Black - F8E244-BLK 9686 F8E244-BLK $4.50 The Tree House, Inc.
H
EAC | Gel Filled Cushion Wrist Pad, Black - Belkin WaveRest - 6044 F8E244-BLK $4.50 The Tree House, Inc.
H F8E244-BLK
EAC | Wireless Mouse Kensington K72405US Pro Fit Mid-Size - 00219 K72405US $27.10 The Tree House, Inc.
H 2.4Ghz, 1750 DPI, Optical Sensor, Right-Handed Design,

Ergonomic
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EAC | MOUSE WIRELESS MINI TRAVEL BLUE VERBATIM 8555 2136006 $17.65 MOUSE WIRELESS MINI School Specialty, LLC
H VER97471/EACH TRAVEL BLUE VERBATIM (Ref # Q-430299)
VER97471/EACH
EAC | MOUSE PAD WITH GEL WRIST REST BLACK COMPUCESSORY 37014 1124852 $20.15 MOUSE PAD WITH GEL School Specialty, LLC
H CCS23718/EACH WRIST REST BLACK (Ref # Q-430299)
COMPUCESSORY
CCS23718/EACH
EAC MOUSE PAD W/WRIST REST PLUSHTOUCH BLACK/EACH 31500 2134645 $24.49 MOUSE PAD W/WRIST School Specialty, LLC
H REST PLUSHTOUCH (Ref # Q-430299)
BLACK/EACH
EAC | Wrist Rest for Slim Keyboards - Kensington ErgoSoft 51441 K52800WW $19.00 Atlaz International
H K52800WW
EAC | Keyboard/Mouse, Logitech MK520 Wireless Desktop Set - 6058 MK520 $36.00 Atlaz International
H USB, Black
EAC | Corsair K95 RGB Platinum 1170 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Wireless Mouse - Logitech M525 - Black 6054 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Mouse 4500 - Microsoft Comfort Mouse - optical - 5 buttons 6061 NO BID NO BID
H - wired - USB
EAC | Mouse 3600 Microsoft Bluetooth Mobile - Bluetooth 4.0, 6062 NO BID NO BID
H 4-Way Scroll, Compact, Ambidextrous - PN7-00021
EAC | Wisfox 2.4G, 6 Button Cordless Mouse, for Windows Mac PC 85551 NO BID NO BID
H Notebook, Sky Blue
Lamination Equipment & Supplies
PKG | Laminating Pouch, Thermal Royal Sovereign 5 mil Heat 07018 Scotch 2657098 $6.97 Quill LLC -
Sealed, 100/Pack (RFO5IDNU0100) (Quill Bid #24-32007)
PKG | 3 mil Laminating Pouches Letter Size, Fellowes 120 Bonus 564121 Fellowes 1530746 $13.67 Quill LLC -
Pack (100+20 Free) (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 9" Thermal Laminator, Scotch PRO, Anti-Jam (TL906) 719036 Scotch TL906 $50.27 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 9.5" Callisto 95 Laminator 5788 Fellowes 398764 $99.27 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 12.5" Callisto 125 Laminator 5782 Fellowes 5729101 $131.06 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
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EAC | 12.5" Thermal and Cold Laminator - Fellowes CALLISTO 1320544 Fellowes 5729101 $131.06 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Mount-It! Adjustable Vented Aluminum Laptop Stand for 56109 MOMI7210 $23.47 B&H Photo Video
H 17.5" Laptops, Black (MI-7210) (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Laptop Slip Case 15.4", Black with Gray Accent - Targus 6123 TACVR200 $39.00 B&H Photo Video
H CVR200 (Ref #2024108)
EAC | Stylus Pen for Dell 2-in-1 Laptop Pencil, Pen for Dell 37098 BoB69SM $32.00 Atlaz International

H 7420/5591/5490 2-in-1, for Dell 2-in-1 Latitude
9520/9510/7420/7410, XPS 9310/7390, Precision 5530,
Stylus Pencil for Dell 2-in-1 Laptop Pen
EAC | Laptop Slip Case 15.4", Black with Gray Accent - Targus 6123 CFR200 $39.00 Atlaz International
H CVR200
EAC | ePen Stylus for iPad, iPhone, and Galaxy (Red) - iLuv 221340 NO BID NO BID
H ICS801RED
EAC | Stylus Pen - HYPERKIN Tomee Retractable Metallic for 3DS 23135 NO BID NO BID
H (4-Pack) - M05762
EAC | Laptop Riser, 13 1/4x9 3/8 x 4 1/4, Black 6079 NO BID NO BID
H
Misc. Computer Equipment
EAC | 2 Pack 3.2ft USB Power Charger Cable Data Charging Cord for 2023856 NO BID NO BID
H TI-84 Plus CE/ Plus C, Tl Nspire CX/ CX CAS Texas Instruments
Graphing Calculators, PS3 Controller and More - Type A to
Mini B USB Cable
EAC | USB Type C SD Card Reader, USB 3.0 SD Card Reader OTG 203115 NO BID NO BID
H Adapter for SDXC, SDHC, MMC, RS-MMC, Micro SDXC, Micro
SD, TF, Micro SDHC Card and UHS-I Cards for Mac OS
Windows Linux Andriod
EAC | XFX Radeon RX 7600 SPEEDSTER SWFT210 CORE Gaming 37166 NO BID NO BID
H Graphics Card
EAC | HDMI Type A to VGA Converter with Audio Output 3594270 Manhattan 2580990 $16.64 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Air Circulator Fan, Honeywell Turbo Force Black, 9" - HT900 49011 Honeywell HT900 $16.88 Quill LLC -
H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 6inch Short USB C Charging Cord, 5 Pack Durable USB A to 2023702 BOSLL1SVZ $12.00 Atlaz International
H USB Type C 3A Fast Charging Cable for Charging Station
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EAC | Charging Station for Multiple Devices - 6 Port Fast Charging 203062 BO8G1JRW $41.00 Atlaz International
H Station for iPhone iPad Android and Tablet - Multi Charging
Station - Phone Charging Station with 6 Mixed Cables
Included(UL Certified)
EAC | Small Electric 5Pack Short iPhone Charger Cable 1FT 203113 BO78XDLDNM $12.50 Atlaz International
H Lightning Cable 1 Foot Charging Station Portable Desktop
Cord for iPhone 12 11 Pro X XS Max XR / 8/8 Plus / 7 Plus / 6
Plus / 5S / iPad/iPod and Power Bank, Gold
EAC | Sabrent USB 3.0 Type-A and Type-C OTG Card Reader, BH 203112 SACRBCA2 $18.00 Atlaz International
H Photo - SACRBCA2
EAC | Portable USB External DVD Burner and Drive 9988594 DVDRW-USB $35.00 Atlaz International
H
EAC | Unitek Multi Charging Station, 10-Port USB Charger for 203114 BO1AW9Z $60.00 Atlaz International
H Multiple Device with SmartIC Tech and Adjustable Dividers,
Organizer Stand Compatible with iPad, Tablet, Kindle, iPhone
EAC | Crazy 3D Print CZ-300 DIY 3D Printer from XYZ printing 37167 CZ-300 $188.00 Atlaz International
H
Xerox - Toner Cartridges
EAC | Toner for Xerox Versalink7000 color printer - High Capacity - 37195 106R03757 $193.55 The Tree House, Inc.
H Black
EAC | Toner for Xerox Versalink7000 color printer, High Capacity - 37194 106R03760 $327.10 The Tree House, Inc.
H Cyan
EAC | Toner for Xerox Versalink7000 color printer, High Capacity - 37193 106R03759 $327.10 The Tree House, Inc.
H Magenta
EAC | Toner for Xerox Versalink7000 color printer, High 37192 106R03758 $327.10 The Tree House, Inc.
H Capacity-Yellow
Monitors & Monitor Stands
EAC | Monitor Stand 14969-1001 14969100 NO BID NO BID
H 1
EAC | 32" LG Monitor - 16:9 IPS - 1920 X 1080 Resolution - 6872 NO BID NO BID
H 32MP58HQ-P
EAC | 22" Monitor P2222H 20027A $166.00 P2222H Atlaz International
H

Paper Shredders
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EAC | Paper Shredder - Fellowes Automax 150C 6052 Fellowes 1973990 $306.02 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | Powershred 73ci 100 Percent Jam Proof Shredder - Fellowes 22545 1293696 $355.68 School Specialty, LLC
H 1438710 (Ref # Q-430299)

Photo Papers & Films
PKG | 8-1/2" X 11" Epson Glossy Photo Paper - 50 Sheets/Pkg - 1673 EPPGL25 $12.68 5042183 B&H Photo Video
S042183 (Ref #2024108)
PKG | 8-1/2" X 11" HP Photo Paper, Inkjet Glossy, HP Premium - 6074 HEPP851150G $21.98 CR664A B&H Photo Video
50/Pkg (Ref #2024108)
PKG | 13" X 19" Epson Matte Paper Premium Photo, Inkjet - 50/Pkg 15836 EPEMSB50 $35.32 S041339 B&H Photo Video
(Ref #2024108)
PKG | 13" X 19" Epson Semi-Gloss Paper Premium Photo, Inkjet - 15838 EPPSGSB20 $36.00 S041327 B&H Photo Video
20/Pkg (Ref #2024108)
PKG | 13" X 19" Epson Glossy Premium Photo Paper - Inkjet - 15837 EPPGSB20 $37.18 S041289 B&H Photo Video
20/Pkg (Ref #2024108)
ROLL | 24" X 100' Epson White Proof Paper, Semi Matte - Roll 10075 EPPWSM24100 $99.00 S042004 B&H Photo Video
(Ref #2024108)
ROLL | 24" X 100' Epson (250) White Premium Paper, Gloss - Roll 10076 EPPG24100 $104.00 S041638 B&H Photo Video
(Ref #2024108)
EAC | Epson Photo Paper, Roll 36"x100' 56126 EPPG36100Z $119.00 S041391 B&H Photo Video
H (Ref #2024108)
Presentation Remotes
EAC | Laser Presentation Remote 34366 Logitech 24342681 $33.31 Quill LLC -

H (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | PRESENTER REMOTE WIRELESS KENSINGTON 6069 2136125 $45.32 PRESENTER REMOTE School Specialty, LLC
H KMW33272/EACH WIRELESS KENSINGTON (Ref # Q-430299)

KMW33272/EACH

EAC | Professional Presenter Logitech R800 - Presentation remote 6066 910-001350 $49.00 Atlaz International

H control - (910-001350) - 7880043

Robotics & 3D Printers

EAC | Makerbot PLA Filament 1288 Makerbot $45.49 Quill LLC -

H IM1UR7977IN (Quill Bid #24-32007)

STEM

PKG Edison Spare Parts Kit 998544 EDISPARTS $24.00 Atlaz International
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EAC | Elenco Snap Circuits Jr. 998539 SC100 $49.00 Atlaz International

H
PKG | Osmo Genius Kits 998545 OSMOGENSTARTERKIT $112.00 Atlaz International
EAC | Spheros Bolt - SKU KOO2ROW 998550 KOO2ROW $196.00 Atlaz International

H
EAC | Gizmo Labs 37169 NO BID NO BID

H

Texas Instruments Calculators
EAC | TI-30XA Scientific Calculator, Trigonometric, Logarithms, 572555 Texas Instruments $8.86 Quill LLC -
H 3-1/10 X 4/5 X 6 In., Black TI30OXA (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | TI-30XS Texas Instruments Multi-View Scientific Calculator - 091224 Texas Instruments $13.61 Quill LLC -
H 16-Digit 4-Line Dual Power, Multiple Calculation. TI30XS (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | TI-83 Plus Graphing Calculator 038117 Texas Instruments $88.12 Quill LLC -
H TI83PLUS (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | TI-84 Plus Graphing Calculator 078653 Texas Instruments $96.93 Quill LLC -
H TI84PLUS (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | TI-84 Plus CE Graphing Calculator 35421 Texas Instruments $115.60 Quill LLC -
H 1558167 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | TI Nspire Cx graphing calculator 35801A Texas Instruments $122.99 Quill LLC -
H 321965 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | TI-108 Texas Instruments Solar Powered Elementary 064053 064053 $5.31 School Specialty, LLC
H Calculator (Ref # Q-430299)
EAC | TI-1706 SV Texas Instruments, Calculator 8-Digit, SuperView 03824 TI-1706SV $7.35 Atlaz International
H Display, Protective Slide Case, Battery/Solar Powered

EAC | TI-30X IIS Texas Instruments Scientific Calculator 038122 TI-30XI1S $12.65 Atlaz International
H

PKG | TI-108 Solar Powered Elementary Calculators - 10/Pkg 064056 T1-108/10 $49.50 Atlaz International

PKG | TI-30X IIS Advanced Scientific Calculator - 10/Pkg 038121 TI-30XI11S/10 $128.00 Atlaz International

EAC | Ti Nspire graphing calculator docking station TI Nspire CX 35802 N3DS/PWB/2L1 $130.00 Atlaz International
H graphing calculator docking stations

PKG | TI84 Plus EZ Spot Texas Instruments Graphing Calculator - 081052 TI84PLUSTKYEL $1,145.0 Atlaz International

10/Pkg 0

EAC | Texas Instruments TI-Nspire CX Il EZ Spot Teacher Pack 56092 NSCX2/TPK/2L1 $1,605.0 Atlaz International

H 0

Tools & Cable Kits
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L9 Description e endol Bid Price BlEE Company Name
M P Item # Product # Brand pany
KIT | Computer Tool Kit - Fellowes 55-Piece - Black Vinyl Zipper 14143 NO BID NO BID
Case - 49106
USB Jump Drive/Flash Drive
EAC | 64GB USB Flash Drive - USB 2.0, Plug & Play, Black 6068 NXT Technologies $4.48 Quill LLC -
H 24529663 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 32GB Drive - Flash Drive - SanDisk Cruzer Switch USB 2.0, 14786 SanDisk 642408 $7.01 Quill LLC -
H Flip-top Design, SecureAccess Software, Keychain Loop - (Quill Bid #24-32007)
SDCZ52-032G-B35
EAC | 128GB USB Flash Drive - USB 2.0 6072 NXT Technologies $8.34 Quill LLC -
H 24529661 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
EAC | 32GB Flash Jump Drive -PC/Mac Compatible 4481 DSP32GB-001 $5.95 The Tree House, Inc.
H
EAC | 32GB Ultra Dual Drive USB Type-C Flash Drive 8633 DSP32GB-001 $5.95 The Tree House, Inc.
H
EAC | 32GB Flash Drive, Dual USB 3.0 Type-A & Type-C 10379 SDDDC2-032G-A46 $12.95 The Tree House, Inc.
H
EAC | 16GB, USB Flash Drive - USB 3.0 2957 USB-16GB-2.0 $4.70 Atlaz International
H
EAC | 32GB USB Flash Drive - USB 2.0 6065 USB-32GB-2.0 $4.90 Atlaz International
H
EAC | 32GB USB Flash Drive - USB 3.0 6045 USB-32GB-3.0 $5.00 Atlaz International
H
Vinyl Printer Supplies
EAC | Roland Eco Solvent Max ink 220 mL black for BN20 - 3597620 NO BID NO BID
H (ESL3-BK)
EAC | Roland Eco Solvent Max ink 220 mL cyan BN20 - (ESL3-CY) 3597621 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Roland Eco Solvent Max ink 220 mL Magenta BN20 - 3597622 NO BID NO BID
H (ESL3-MG)
EAC | Roland Eco Solvent Max ink 220 mL yellow BN20 - (ESL3-YE) 3597623 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | RapidTac - Application Fluid 300z w/ Sprayer 3597634 NO BID NO BID
H
Webcam & Voice Recorders
EAC | Blue Microphone - Snowball Wired Condenser USB (Gloss 50241 Blue Microphones $49.00 Quill LLC -
H Black) - 836213001912 2636984 (Quill Bid #24-32007)
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uo Description BOCES L Bid Price e nate Company Name
M Item # Product # Brand
EAC | RODE NTG2 Shotgun Microphone HDSLR Location Recording 56114 RONTG2BK2 $302.30 RODE NTG2 Shotgun B&H Photo Video
H Kit Microphone HDSLR (Ref #2024108)
Location Recording Kit
EAC | Sony ICD-PX470 Digital Voice Recorder with USB 6801 SOICDPX470 $54.50 Sony ICD-PX470 Digital B&H Photo Video
H Voice Recorder with (Ref #2024108)
USB
EAC | Rolls MM11 Pro Microphone Mute/Talk Switch 37154 ROMM11PRO $54.95 B&H Photo Video

(Ref #2024108)




